
 
 

   
 

   SCANS Matrix  
Program: AAS Law Enforcement  Program: Law Enforcement  

CIP: 43.0107  
LIST ALL COURSES REQUIRED AND IDENTIFIED COMPETENCIES  

   Competencies    
Course Number  Course Title  1  2  3  4  5  6  7  8  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 1301  Introduction to Criminal Justice  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 1310  Fundamentals of Criminal Law  

X  X    X  X        ENGL 1301  Composition 1  

X    X  X  X        MATH  College Level Math  

X      X  X      X  COSC 1301  Microcomputer Applications  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 1306  Courts & Criminal Procedure  

X  X  X  X  X        CRIJ 1307  Crime in America or SBS elective  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 2313  Corrections Systems & Practices  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 2323  Legal Aspects of Law Enforcement  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 2328  Police Systems and Practices  

X      X  X        HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS  Humanities or Performing/Visual Arts  

X  X    X  X        CRIJ 2301  Community Resources in Corrections  

X      X  X  X  X    CJLE 1506  Basic Peace Officer I  

X      X  X  X  X    CJLE 1512  Basic Peace Officer II  

X      X  X  X  X    CJLE 1518 CC  Basic Peace Officer III  

X      X  X  X  X    CJLE 1524  Basic Peace Officer IV  

X      X  X  X  X    CJLE 1429 Basic Peace Officer V  

COMPETENCY REFERENCES  
  8 Basic use of computers  
  7 Workplace Competencies: resources; interpersonal skills; informa�on; systems; 

and technology.   
  6 Personal Quali�es: A worker must display responsibility, self-esteem, sociability, self- 

management, integrity, and honesty.   
  5 Thinking Skills: A worker must think crea�vely, make decisions, solve problems, visualize, know 

how to learn, and reason effec�vely.   
  4 Speaking and Listening: Organize ideas and communicate orally; receive, atend to, interpret, and 

respond to verbal messages and other cues.   
  3 Arithme�c or Mathema�cs: Perform basic computa�ons and approach prac�cal problems by choosing 

appropriately from a variety of mathema�cal techniques.   
  2 Wri�ng: Communicate thoughts, ideas, informa�on, and messages in wri�ng, and create documents such as 

leters, direc�ons, manuals, reports, graphs, and flow charts.   
1 Reading: Locate, understand, and interpret writen informa�on in prose and in documents such as manuals, graphs, 
and schedules.   
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SCANS Competencies Checklist  

Academic Year:  2023/2024  
SCANS COMPETENCIES FOR PROGRAM: Law Enforcement AAS  

Competency  Course where 
Competency is Assessed  Method of Assessment  Improvements as a Result  

of Assessment Findings  
1 READING: Locate, understand,  
and interpret writen 
informa�on in prose and in 
documents such as manuals, 
graphs, and schedules.    

 CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, MATH, COSC 1301, CRIJ  
1306, CRIJ 1307, CRIJ 2313,  
CRIJ 2323, CRIJ  
2328, HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS,  
CJLE 1506, CJLE 1512, CJLE  
1518 CC, CJLE 1524, CJLE 1429,  
CRIJ 2301  

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies 
in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  

2 WRITING: Communicate 
thoughts, ideas, informa�on, 
and messages in wri�ng, and 
create documents such as 
leters, direc�ons, manuals, 
reports, graphs, and flow charts.  

 CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, CRIJ 1306, CRIJ 1307,  
CRIJ 2313, CRIJ  
2323, CRIJ 2328, CRIJ 2301  

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies in 
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  

3 ARITHMETIC OR  
MATHEMATICS: Perform basic 
computa�ons and approach 
prac�cal problems by choosing 
appropriately from a variety of 
mathema�cal techniques.  

 MATH, CRIJ 1307,   Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies 
in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  

4 SPEAKING AND LISTENING: 
Organize ideas and 
communicate orally; receive, 
atend to, interpret, and 
respond to verbal messages and 
other cues.  

 CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, MATH, COSC 1301, CRIJ  
1306, CRIJ 1307, CRIJ 2313,  
CRIJ 2323, CRIJ  
2328, HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS,  
CJLE 1506, CJLE 1512, CJLE  
1518 CC, CJLE 1524, CJLE  
1429, CRIJ 2301  

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies 
in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  

5 THINKING SKILLS: A worker 
must think crea�vely, make 
decisions, solve problems, 
visualize, know how to learn, 
and reason effec�vely.  

 CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, MATH, COSC 1301, CRIJ  
1306, CRIJ 1307, CRIJ 2313,  
CRIJ 2323, CRIJ  
2328, HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS,  
CJLE 1506, CJLE 1512, CJLE  
1518 CC, CJLE 1524, CJLE  
1429, CRIJ 2301  

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies 
in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  

6 PERSONAL QUALITIES: A 
worker must display 
responsibility, self-esteem, 
sociability, self-management, 
integrity, and honesty.  

CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, MATH, COSC 1301, CRIJ  
1306, CRIJ 1307, CRIJ 2313,  
CRIJ 2323, CRIJ  
2328, HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS,  
CJLE 1506, CJLE 1512, CJLE  
1518 CC, CJLE 1524, CJLE  
1429, CRIJ 2301 

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports   

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies in 
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  
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7 WORKPLACE COMPETENCIES:  
resources; interpersonal skills; 
informa�on; systems; and 
technology  

CRIJ 1301, CRIJ 1310, ENGL  
1301, MATH, COSC 1301, CRIJ  
1306, CRIJ 1307, CRIJ 2313,  
CRIJ 2323, CRIJ  
2328, HUMA/VIS/PERF. ARTS,  
CJLE 1506, CJLE 1512, CJLE  
1518 CC, CJLE 1524, CJLE  
1429, CRIJ 2301 

 Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies 
in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written  

Competency  Course where 
Competency is Assessed  Method of Assessment  Improvements as a Result  

of Assessment Findings  
   assignments. Completion and 

passage rates have improved.  

8 BASIC USE OF COMPUTERS   COSC 1301    Tests, quizzes, discussions, 
homework, papers/analysis reports  

Failure to complete written 
assignments and course 
requirements and deficiencies in  
writing ability are a persistent 
problem. Students are encouraged 
to take advantage of available 
tutoring and increased emphasis is 
being placed on written 
assignments. Completion and 
passage rates have improved.  
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